
[[688511]] VOLVO ECR145 310112 - SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP455115
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 80W140
Job No: 688511

HUBBARD CONSTRUCTION303 WEST LANDSTREET ROADORLANDO, FLUS  32824Contact: RAY BIRKOray.birko@hubbard.comT: (407)855-3535F: (407)857-1282
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. The fluid was notspecified, however, a fluid matchindicates that this fluid is (GENERIC)GEAR OIL SAE 80W140.  Pleaseconfirm. All component wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: HUBORLUnique No: 10942416Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 26 Mar 2024
Report Id: HUBORL [WUSCAR] 06128265 (Generated: 03/26/2024 17:33:15) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RAY BIRKO - HUBORL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP455115 VCP320427 VCP274893 VCP223745Sample Date 19 Mar 2024 25 Aug 2021 17 Apr 2020 17 Aug 2018Machine Hours 6977 5286 4249 2411Oil Hours 0 0 0 2411Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL NORMAL ATTENTION ATTENTION
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 238 275 159 149.1
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 10 4 13 10Sodium ppm 0 1 4 4Potassium ppm 1 0 3 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 482 85 383 403Copper ppm 12 7 19 21Lead ppm 1 0 <1 1Tin ppm <1 0 0 0Aluminum ppm 3 0 1 1Chromium ppm 4 <1 4 4Molybdenum ppm 3 2 0 0Nickel ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 <1 0 0Manganese ppm 4 1 4 4Vanadium ppm <1 0 <1 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 56 53 29 29Magnesium ppm 13 12 8 9Zinc ppm 101 26 47 42Phosphorus ppm 1114 939 1267 1301Barium ppm 2 0 2 2Boron ppm 143 137 36 35

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: HUBORL [WUSCAR] 06128265 (Generated: 03/26/2024 17:33:18) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RAY BIRKO - HUBORL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO ECR145 310112\Swing Drive [VCP455115] 19 Mar 2024 @ 6977.0 hrs

