
VOLVO A40G 352780 - WET DISC BRAKE

Sample No: VCP445653
Oil Type: VOLVO WET BRAKE TRANSAXLE OIL
Job No:

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY5151 DR MARTIN LUTHER KING BLVDFORT MYERS, FLUS  33905Contact: TODD LARKtlark@altaequipfl.comT: F: (239)481-3302
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.The iron levelis abnormal. The copper level isabnormal. Elemental level of silicon(Si) above normal indicating ingressof seal material. The condition of theoil is acceptable for the time inservice.

Depot: VOLVO0090Unique No: 10942430Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 28 Mar 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0090 [WUSCAR] 06128279 (Generated: 03/28/2024 10:22:26) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TODD LARK - VOLVO0090

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP445653 --- --- ---Sample Date 19 Mar 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 4328 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 40.5 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 32 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 13 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 3 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 48 --- --- ---Copper ppm 357 --- --- ---Lead ppm 1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 10 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 4981 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 13 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 2098 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1905 --- --- ---Barium ppm 1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 169 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0090 [WUSCAR] 06128279 (Generated: 03/28/2024 10:22:28) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TODD LARK - VOLVO0090
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 352780\Wet Disc Brake [VCP445653] 19 Mar 2024 @ 4328.0 hrs

