
[TMR-SARASOTA] VOLVO L90E 66644 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP445955
Oil Type: VOLVO AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID AT102
Job No:

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY5151 DR MARTIN LUTHER KING BLVDFORT MYERS, FLUS  33905Contact: TODD LARKtlark@altaequipfl.comT: F: (239)481-3302
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0090Unique No: 10942440Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 26 Mar 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0090 [WUSCAR] 06128289 (Generated: 03/26/2024 17:32:26) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TODD LARK - VOLVO0090

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP445955 DJJ037726 DJJ015903 DJJ015495Sample Date 20 Mar 2024 05 Mar 2019 15 Oct 2015 21 Oct 2014Machine Hours 2244 14754 4085 3735Oil Hours 0 1000 1000 0Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Changed N/ASample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 27.9 31.02 28.99 26.45
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 4 3 2 3Sodium ppm 1 <1 3 4Potassium ppm 2 1 <1 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 73 3 2 3Copper ppm 5 4 5 8Lead ppm <1 0 <1 <1Tin ppm <1 0 0 <1Aluminum ppm 3 0 0 <1Chromium ppm <1 0 0 0Molybdenum ppm 1 <1 <1 <1Nickel ppm <1 <1 0 <1Titanium ppm <1 <1 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 3 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 102 135 308 167Magnesium ppm 3 0 <1 0Zinc ppm 31 42 95 18Phosphorus ppm 222 156 292 246Barium ppm 1 0 0 0Boron ppm 93 75 74 79

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0090 [WUSCAR] 06128289 (Generated: 03/26/2024 17:32:30) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TODD LARK - VOLVO0090
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90E 66644\Transmission (Auto) [VCP445955] 20 Mar 2024 @ 2244.0 hrs

