
[[STEMBERG CONSTR]] VOLVO A25D 15269 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP346325
Oil Type: MOBIL DELVAC 1300 SUPER15W40
Job No: STEMBERG CONSTR

TRI-STATE TRUCK & EQUIP INC MAINPO BOX 1298BILLINGS, MTUS  59103Contact: MIKE HOLLIDAYmikeh@tste.comT: (406)671-2416F: (406)238-1501
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Oil and filter change atthe time of sampling has been noted.Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. Fuel content negligible.Elemental level of silicon (Si) abovenormal indicating ingress of sealmaterial. The oil viscosity is lowerthan normal. The BN result indicatesthat there is suitable alkalinityremaining in the oil. Confirm oil type.

Depot: VOLVO0104Unique No: 10943356Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 28 Mar 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0104 [WUSCAR] 06129205 (Generated: 03/28/2024 16:06:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE HOLLIDAY - VOLVO0104

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP346325 --- --- ---Sample Date 11 Mar 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 50 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 11.8 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.2 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 64 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Soot % % 0.1 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 43 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 55 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % 1.9 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 32 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 5 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 5 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 7 --- --- ---Copper ppm 2 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 43 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1813 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 411 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 892 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 781 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 66 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0104 [WUSCAR] 06129205 (Generated: 03/28/2024 16:06:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE HOLLIDAY - VOLVO0104
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A25D 15269\Diesel Engine [VCP346325] 11 Mar 2024 @ .0 hrs

