
[[X47542]]  - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP434974
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: X47542

SCOTT EQUIPMENT COMPANY LLC - Lavergne1231 BRIDGESTONE PARKWAYLAVERGNE, TNUS  37086Contact: ANDY CHAMBERSachambers@scottcompanies.comT: F: (615)793-9655
Diagnosis
We recommend you service the filterson this component. Resample at thenext service interval to monitor. Wewere unable to perform a particlecount due to a high concentration ofparticles present in this sample.Theiron level is abnormal. All othercomponent wear rates are normal.Appearance is milky. There is a lightconcentration of water present in theoil. There is a moderate amount ofvisible silt present in the sample. TheAN level is acceptable for this fluid.

Depot: VOLVO0129Unique No: 10943505Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 29 Mar 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0129 [WUSCAR] 06129354 (Generated: 04/05/2024 07:34:32) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ANDY CHAMBERS - VOLVO0129

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP434974 VCP339089 --- ---Sample Date 21 Mar 2024 23 Jun 2022 --- ---Machine Hours 6188 4252 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed N/A N/A --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 43.0 43.0 --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.35 0.24 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.230 NEG --- ---Particles >4µm --- 20600 --- ---Particles >6µm --- 412 --- ---Particles >14µm --- 20 --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) --- 22/16/11 --- ---Silicon ppm 5 1 --- ---Sodium ppm 0 0 --- ---Potassium ppm 2 0 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 23 2 --- ---Copper ppm 22 17 --- ---Lead ppm 1 0 --- ---Tin ppm 1 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 <1 --- ---Chromium ppm 5 <1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 3 <1 --- ---Nickel ppm <1 0 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 <1 --- ---Manganese ppm 2 0 --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 70 85 --- ---Magnesium ppm 7 0 --- ---Zinc ppm 392 159 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 371 385 --- ---Barium ppm 1 0 --- ---Boron ppm 0 1 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0129 [WUSCAR] 06129354 (Generated: 04/05/2024 07:34:33) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ANDY CHAMBERS - VOLVO0129
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO \Hydraulic System [VCP434974] 21 Mar 2024 @ 6187.6 hrs

