
[[X47542]] VOLVO EC380EL 311913 - SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP439332
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 80W90
Job No: X47542

SCOTT EQUIPMENT COMPANY LLC - Lavergne1231 BRIDGESTONE PARKWAYLAVERGNE, TNUS  37086Contact: ANDY CHAMBERSachambers@scottcompanies.comT: F: (615)793-9655
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. Werecommend that you drain the oilfrom the component if this has notalready been done. We recommendan early resample to monitor thiscondition.Bearing and/or bushingwear is indicated. There is a very highconcentration of water present in theoil. The oil is no longer serviceabledue to the presence of contaminants.

Depot: VOLVO0129Unique No: 10943803Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 29 Mar 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0129 [WUSCAR] 06129652 (Generated: 04/11/2024 14:46:59) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ANDY CHAMBERS - VOLVO0129

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP439332 VCP340406 --- ---Sample Date 21 Mar 2024 23 Jun 2022 --- ---Machine Hours 6188 4252 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed N/A N/A --- ---Sample Status SEVERE ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 159 141 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 5.46 0.876 --- ---Silicon ppm 24 17 --- ---Sodium ppm <1 0 --- ---Potassium ppm 2 <1 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 1190 957 --- ---Copper ppm 67 57 --- ---Lead ppm <1 <1 --- ---Tin ppm 2 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 5 4 --- ---Chromium ppm 10 7 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 <1 --- ---Nickel ppm <1 0 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 <1 --- ---Manganese ppm 8 6 --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 58 26 --- ---Magnesium ppm 4 1 --- ---Zinc ppm 86 67 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 966 919 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 25 30 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0129 [WUSCAR] 06129652 (Generated: 04/11/2024 14:47:01) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ANDY CHAMBERS - VOLVO0129
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC380EL 311913\Swing Drive [VCP439332] 21 Mar 2024 @ 6187.6 hrs

