
[[12583 DAKOTA]] VOLVO L35GS 3424358 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCE72657
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 80W-90 GL-5
Job No: 12583 DAKOTA

TRANSOURCE TRUCK & EQUIPMENT901 EAST 60TH STREET NORTHSIOUX FALLS, SDUS  57104Contact: ANITA LOSETHanitaloseth@sheehanmacksales.comT: (605)336-2000F: (605)336-2248
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. Tests do not reveal causefor reported.All component wearrates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0035Unique No: 10949544Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 29 Mar 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0035 [WUSCAR] 06130079 (Generated: 03/29/2024 17:09:03) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ANITA LOSETH - VOLVO0035

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCE72657 --- --- ---Sample Date 20 Mar 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 3187 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 189 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 30 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 4 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 3 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 271 --- --- ---Copper ppm 2 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 4 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 2 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 11 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 58 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 13 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 78 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 2130 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 4 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0035 [WUSCAR] 06130079 (Generated: 03/29/2024 17:09:06) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ANITA LOSETH - VOLVO0035
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L35GS 3424358\Rear Axle [VCE72657] 20 Mar 2024 @ 3187.0 hrs

