
VOLVO A40G 342112 - DROP BOX

Sample No: VCP0007904
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No:

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY8750 PHILIPS HWYJACKSONVILLE, FLUS  32256Contact: SHAWN NORTHCRAFTshawn.northcraft@altg.comT: (904)737-6000F: (904)737-1260
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0092Unique No: 10962598Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 05 Apr 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0092 [WUSCAR] 06137790 (Generated: 04/05/2024 14:54:08) Rev: 1 Submitted By: TECHNICIAN ACCOUNT

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP0007904 VCP0006347 VCP290062 VCP259545Sample Date 29 Mar 2024 07 Feb 2023 30 Oct 2020 02 Dec 2019Machine Hours 7550 7550 4895 3705Oil Hours 7550 0 0 0Oil Changed N/A N/A Not Changd ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ATTENTION
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 212 213 216 47.5
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 30 34 12 4Sodium ppm 3 2 0 4Potassium ppm 5 4 4 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 204 276 78 244Copper ppm 1 2 <1 2Lead ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Tin ppm <1 0 0 0Aluminum ppm 15 20 5 2Chromium ppm 3 5 2 2Molybdenum ppm 16 21 14 0Nickel ppm <1 2 <1 <1Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 4 4 1 4Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 459 461 406 165Magnesium ppm 94 98 86 <1Zinc ppm 272 258 240 78Phosphorus ppm 1026 849 831 1861Barium ppm 0 0 <1 0Boron ppm 134 135 136 85

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0092 [WUSCAR] 06137790 (Generated: 04/05/2024 14:54:11) Rev: 1 Submitted By: TECHNICIAN ACCOUNT
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 342112\Drop Box [VCP0007904] 29 Mar 2024 @ 7550.0 hrs

