
[[J&J]] LEEBOY 8510 380948 - DIESEL FUELSample No: VCP362528
Oil Type: No.2 DIESEL FUEL (ULTRALOW SULPHUR)

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY4136 NORTH DONOVAN WAYLAS VEGAS, NVUS  89030Contact: JOHN VENTURAjventura@arnoldmachinery.comT: (702)642-9000F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time.All metal levels arenormal indicating no corrosion in thesystem. Tests indicate that there is nogasoline present in the fuel. Thewater content is negligible. There isno indication of any contamination inthe fuel. The condition of the fuel isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO5856Unique No: 10962660Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 12 Apr 2024
Report Id: VOLVO5856 [WUSCAR] 06137852 (Generated: 04/16/2024 11:33:23) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN VENTURA - VOLVO5856

 SAMPLE INFORMATION
Sample Number VCP362528 --- --- ---Sample Date 26 Mar 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 546 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 FUEL CONDITION
Sulfur ppm 0 --- --- ---Visc @ 40°C cSt 2.66 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION
Water % 0.003 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO5856 [WUSCAR] 06137852 (Generated: 04/16/2024 11:33:23) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN VENTURA - VOLVO5856
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	LEEBOY LEEBOY 8510 380948\Diesel Fuel [VCP362528] 26 Mar 2024 @ 546.0 hrs

