
[[SWO-070808 H&E EQUIP]] JLG 10054 0160072740 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP436277
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 15W40
Job No: SWO-070808 H&E EQUIP

COWIN EQUIPMENT COMPANY2238 PINSON VALLEY PARKWAYBIRMINGHAM, ALUS  35217Contact: BRANTLY CLAYbclay@cowin.comT: F: (205)856-2106
Diagnosis
We advise that you check the airfilter, air induction system, and anyareas where dirt may enter thecomponent. We recommend that youdrain the oil and perform a filterservice on this component if notalready done. We recommend thatyou drain the oil and perform a filterservice on this component if notalready done. We recommend anearly resample to monitor thiscondition.Piston, ring and cylinderwear is indicated. Metal levels appearhigh for a new component breakingin. Elemental levels of silicon (Si) andaluminum (Al) indicate alumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. The oilis no longer serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: VOLVO8528Unique No: 10963043Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 08 Apr 2024
Report Id: VOLVO8528 [WUSCAR] 06138235 (Generated: 04/08/2024 09:24:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRANTLY CLAY - VOLVO8528

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP436277 --- --- ---Sample Date 01 Apr 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 8 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.6 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.4 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 71 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Soot % % 0.3 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 98 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 63 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 261 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 5 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 13 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 479 --- --- ---Copper ppm 15 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 73 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 33 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 82 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 5 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 15 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 6 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2087 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 158 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1146 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 983 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 104 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8528 [WUSCAR] 06138235 (Generated: 04/08/2024 09:24:14) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRANTLY CLAY - VOLVO8528
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	JLG JLG 10054 0160072740\Diesel Engine [VCP436277] 01 Apr 2024 @ 8.0 hrs

