
[[SWO-070729]] EPIROC D60-10 TMG23SED0506 - COMPRESSOR

Sample No: VCP436283
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No: SWO-070729

WHITAKER CONTRACTING692 CONVICT CAMP RDGUNTERSVILLE, ALUS  35976Contact: BROTHER WHITAKERBrotherWhitaker@whitaker-contracting.comT: (256)298-3905F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. Please specify the brand,type, and viscosity of the oil on yournext sample.All component wearrates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: WHIGUNUnique No: 10963659Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 06 Apr 2024
Report Id: WHIGUN [WUSCAR] 06138851 (Generated: 04/06/2024 13:11:09) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BROTHER WHITAKER - WHIGUN

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP436283 VCP449244 --- ---Sample Date 01 Apr 2024 27 Dec 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 558 263 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd --- ---Sample Status NORMAL ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 199 67.5 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Silicon ppm 4 0 --- ---Sodium ppm 5 0 --- ---Potassium ppm 2 0 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 2 0 --- ---Copper ppm <1 0 --- ---Lead ppm <1 0 --- ---Tin ppm <1 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 18 --- ---Chromium ppm <1 1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 0 --- ---Nickel ppm <1 0 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm <1 0 --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 24 8 --- ---Magnesium ppm 3 0 --- ---Zinc ppm 367 16 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 288 55 --- ---Barium ppm 0 4 --- ---Boron ppm 0 0 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: WHIGUN [WUSCAR] 06138851 (Generated: 04/06/2024 13:11:11) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BROTHER WHITAKER - WHIGUN
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	EPIROC EPIROC D60-10 TMG23SED0506\Compressor [VCP436283] 01 Apr 2024 @ 558.0 hrs

