
FORD FORD F350 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP265340
Oil Type: CHEVRON DELO 400 MULTIGRADE 15W40
Job No:

HIGH MAINTENANCE SERVICE1511 WOFFORD DRBURNET, TXUS  78611Contact: BRIAN KRUDOPbkrudop78@gmail.comT: (303)495-4367F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Oil and filter change atthe time of sampling has been noted.Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. Tests do not reveal causefor reported problem.All componentwear rates are normal. Elemental levelof silicon (Si) above normal indicatingingress of seal material. The BN resultindicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: HIGBURTXUnique No: 10963926Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 06 Apr 2024
Report Id: HIGBURTX [WUSCAR] 06139118 (Generated: 04/06/2024 14:01:06) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRIAN KRUDOP - HIGBURTX

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP265340 --- --- ---Sample Date 16 Mar 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 250 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.3 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.4 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 52 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Soot % % 0.1 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 60 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 50 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 69 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 6 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 14 --- --- ---Copper ppm 55 --- --- ---Lead ppm 12 --- --- ---Tin ppm 8 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 18 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1377 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 840 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1290 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1058 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 71 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: HIGBURTX [WUSCAR] 06139118 (Generated: 04/06/2024 14:01:08) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRIAN KRUDOP - HIGBURTX
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	FORD FORD FORD F350\Diesel Engine [VCP265340] 16 Mar 2024 @ .0 hrs

