
[[136482 PARAGON]] VOLVO L120H 14300 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP114331
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 136482 PARAGON

THE GW VAN KEPPEL CO1876 NORTH 105TH EAST AVENUETULSA, OKUS  74116Contact: MIKE DEVOREMDEVORE@VANKEPPEL.COMT: (918)836-8851F: (918)834-1659
Diagnosis
We advise that you check the fuelinjection system. We recommendthat you drain the oil and perform afilter service on this component if notalready done. We recommend anearly resample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. There is a high amount offuel present in the oil. Tests confirmthe presence of fuel in the oil. Fuel ispresent in the oil and is lowering theviscosity. The oil is no longerserviceable due to the presence ofcontaminants.

Depot: VOLVO0053Unique No: 10964408Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 09 Apr 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0053 [WUSCAR] 06139600 (Generated: 04/09/2024 11:43:21) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE DEVORE - VOLVO0053

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP114331 VCP215650 VCP209848 VKC001004Sample Date 21 Mar 2024 19 Jan 2018 14 Sep 2017 24 Jun 2017Machine Hours 25637 2844 928 840Oil Hours 0 0 0 500Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Changed N/ASample Status SEVERE NORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 3.4 14.06 13.31 11.6Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.4 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 43 84 76 60
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.4 0.3 0 0.1Nitration (PA) % 56 75 50 67Sulfation (PA) % 43 58 58 53Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % 43.5 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 6 8 9 23Sodium ppm 5 4 6 4Potassium ppm 2 1 <1 1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 10 56 13 58Copper ppm <1 5 4 23Lead ppm <1 1 0 3Tin ppm <1 2 12 <1Aluminum ppm 4 24 21 103Chromium ppm 0 2 1 6Molybdenum ppm 25 39 43 43Nickel ppm <1 <1 0 0Titanium ppm 0 <1 0 0Silver ppm 0 <1 <1 1Manganese ppm <1 <1 1 4Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 816 1610 1498 1281Magnesium ppm 340 530 617 816Zinc ppm 632 850 933 1043Phosphorus ppm 532 670 792 804Barium ppm 0 0 0 1Boron ppm 11 20 52 37

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0053 [WUSCAR] 06139600 (Generated: 04/09/2024 11:43:24) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE DEVORE - VOLVO0053
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L120H 14300\Diesel Engine [VCP114331] 21 Mar 2024 @ 25637.0 hrs

