
[[41765]] VOLVO A25G 752067 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP447068
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 80W-90 GL-5
Job No: 41765

215 - ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC - CAYCE2303 AIRPORT BLVDCAYCE, SCUS  29033Contact: ROBBY HERLONGrobby.herlong@ascendummachinery.comT: (803)394-6783F: (803)791-9920
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system. Theoil change at the time of samplinghas been noted. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Gear wearis indicated. Elemental levels ofsilicon (Si) and aluminum (Al) indicatealumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress.The oil viscosity is lower than normal.Confirm oil type.

Depot: VOLVO0013Unique No: 10965060Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 09 Apr 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0013 [WUSCAR] 06140252 (Generated: 04/09/2024 10:26:45) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROBBY HERLONG - VOLVO0013

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP447068 VCP343975 --- ---Sample Date 03 Apr 2024 23 Nov 2021 --- ---Machine Hours 2534 531 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed N/A --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 52.4 61.4 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Silicon ppm 98 3 --- ---Sodium ppm 2 0 --- ---Potassium ppm 1 3 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 949 250 --- ---Copper ppm 60 22 --- ---Lead ppm 0 <1 --- ---Tin ppm 2 <1 --- ---Aluminum ppm 6 0 --- ---Chromium ppm 11 6 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 4 11 --- ---Nickel ppm 10 3 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 14 25 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 <1 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 453 134 --- ---Magnesium ppm 23 0 --- ---Zinc ppm 227 46 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 2186 1450 --- ---Barium ppm 0 2 --- ---Boron ppm 234 190 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0013 [WUSCAR] 06140252 (Generated: 04/09/2024 10:26:49) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROBBY HERLONG - VOLVO0013
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A25G 752067\Front Axle [VCP447068] 03 Apr 2024 @ 2534.0 hrs

