
[[SWA523931 USED SALES]] VOLVO L90H 626330 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP370023
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: SWA523931 USED SALES

ALTA EQUIPMENT5985 COURT STREET ROADSYRACUSE, NYUS  13206Contact: JIM STRIGLEJIM.STRIGLE@ALTG.COMT: (315)437-2611F: (315)434-9471
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.Piston andring wear is indicated. Elemental levelof silicon (Si) above normal indicatingingress of seal material. The BN resultindicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil.

Depot: VOLVO0142Unique No: 10965808Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 10 Apr 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0142 [WUSCAR] 06141000 (Generated: 04/10/2024 11:04:19) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM STRIGLE - VOLVO0142

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP370023 --- --- ---Sample Date 01 Apr 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 5007 --- --- ---Oil Hours 507 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.8 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.9 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 79 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Soot % % 0.3 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 76 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 60 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 35 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 4 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 40 --- --- ---Copper ppm 10 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 4 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 73 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 14 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 43 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 5 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1602 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 593 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1159 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1015 --- --- ---Barium ppm 2 --- --- ---Boron ppm 37 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0142 [WUSCAR] 06141000 (Generated: 04/10/2024 11:04:22) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM STRIGLE - VOLVO0142
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 626330\Diesel Engine [VCP370023] 01 Apr 2024 @ 5007.0 hrs

