
[[25211]] VOLVO EC200EL 310140 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP455197
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 25211

218 - ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC - N. CHARLESTON7235 CROSS COUNTRY RD.NORTH CHARLESTON, SCUS  29418Contact: MATT MITCHAMmatt.mitcham@ascendummachinery.comT: F: (843)414-1129
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.The aluminum level isabnormal. All other component wearrates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: VOLVO3387Unique No: 10965824Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 10 Apr 2024
Report Id: VOLVO3387 [WUSCAR] 06141016 (Generated: 04/10/2024 12:27:34) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT MITCHAM - VOLVO3387

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP455197 VCP400705 VCP363560 VCP348102Sample Date 27 Mar 2024 14 Feb 2023 19 Sep 2022 10 Mar 2022Machine Hours 3707 2919 2525 2076Oil Hours 500 1000 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed N/ASample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.1 13.1 13.1 13.6Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.0 9.4 12.0 8.4Oxidation (PA) % 85 80 85 68
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.6 0.9 0.5 0.3Nitration (PA) % 85 89 78 83Sulfation (PA) % 60 60 64 61Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 16 9 13 10Sodium ppm 25 5 2 1Potassium ppm 0 0 <1 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 83 24 52 2Copper ppm 5 2 4 0Lead ppm 0 0 <1 <1Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 18 7 10 <1Chromium ppm 2 1 2 <1Molybdenum ppm 40 45 42 44Nickel ppm 0 <1 0 <1Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1803 1658 1635 1644Magnesium ppm 524 536 539 534Zinc ppm 1173 1169 1065 1089Phosphorus ppm 986 943 887 920Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 25 47 22 76

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO3387 [WUSCAR] 06141016 (Generated: 04/10/2024 12:27:36) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT MITCHAM - VOLVO3387
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC200EL 310140\Diesel Engine [VCP455197] 27 Mar 2024 @ 3707.0 hrs

