
[[AOK SITEWORKS]] VOLVO EC160EL 314355 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCE045812
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: AOK SITEWORKS

TRI-STATE TRUCK & EQUIP INC MAINPO BOX 1298BILLINGS, MTUS  59103Contact: JARED PORTRELLJAREDP@TSTE.COMT: F: (406)238-1501
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. Test do not reveal causefor reported problem.All componentwear rates are normal. The amountand size of particulates present in thesystem are acceptable. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The AN level is acceptable forthis fluid. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: VOLVO0104Unique No: 10966992Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 11 Apr 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0104 [WUSCAR] 06142184 (Generated: 04/11/2024 14:21:23) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JARED PORTRELL - VOLVO0104

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCE045812 --- --- ---Sample Date 06 Mar 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1495 --- --- ---Oil Hours 495 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 44.0 --- --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.64 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Particles >4µm 3450 --- --- ---Particles >6µm 490 --- --- ---Particles >14µm 34 --- --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 19/16/12 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 5 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 0 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 4 --- --- ---Copper ppm 18 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 124 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 1 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 723 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 579 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0104 [WUSCAR] 06142184 (Generated: 04/11/2024 14:21:26) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JARED PORTRELL - VOLVO0104
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC160EL 314355\Hydraulic System [VCE045812] 06 Mar 2024 @ 1495.0 hrs

