
[[52214 IAA]] VOLVO L90H 623642 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP446594
Oil Type: VOLVO WET BRAKE TRANSAXLE OIL
Job No: 52214 IAA

VCES- VOLVO CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT1944 MARINA BLVDSAN LEANDRO, CAUS  94577Contact: DAVE HILDEBRANDdavid.hildebrand@vcesvolvo.comT: (510)357-9131F: (925)294-9240
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO4487Unique No: 10967320Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 11 Apr 2024
Report Id: VOLVO4487 [WUSCAR] 06142512 (Generated: 04/11/2024 14:21:59) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVE HILDEBRAND - VOLVO4487

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP446594 VCP363845 VCP326128 VCP291751Sample Date 03 Apr 2024 04 Jan 2023 29 Oct 2021 10 Nov 2020Machine Hours 12482 10471 8405 6393Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed N/A N/A ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 49.3 47.1 40.6 40.3
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 14 18 12 10Sodium ppm 3 4 2 2Potassium ppm 0 0 <1 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 26 28 41 53Copper ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Lead ppm 0 <1 <1 0Tin ppm <1 <1 0 0Aluminum ppm <1 1 1 0Chromium ppm 0 <1 <1 1Molybdenum ppm 10 <1 <1 <1Nickel ppm 0 <1 0 0Titanium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 <1 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 1 1Vanadium ppm 0 0 <1 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2097 3592 3979 3920Magnesium ppm 135 15 12 11Zinc ppm 1102 1425 1504 1495Phosphorus ppm 896 1125 1311 1308Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 70 109 133 133

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO4487 [WUSCAR] 06142512 (Generated: 04/11/2024 14:22:00) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVE HILDEBRAND - VOLVO4487
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 623642\Front Axle [VCP446594] 03 Apr 2024 @ 12482.0 hrs

