
[[70967]] VOLVO A45G 352798 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP445538
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: 70967

COWIN EQUIPMENT COMPANY7950 PITTMAN AVEPENSACOLA, FLUS  32534Contact: HUGH DOBBSHDOBBS@COWIN.COMT: (850)479-3004F: (850)474-1602
Diagnosis
The filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor. We were unable to performa particle count due to a highconcentration of particles present inthis sample.All component wear ratesare normal. High concentration ofvisible dirt/debris present in the oil.The AN level is acceptable for thisfluid. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: VOLVO8247Unique No: 10967795Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 11 Apr 2024
Report Id: VOLVO8247 [WUSCAR] 06142987 (Generated: 04/12/2024 17:11:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: HUGH DOBBS - VOLVO8247

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP445538 --- --- ---Sample Date 04 Apr 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 3950 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 44.4 --- --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.36 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 18 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 14 --- --- ---Copper ppm 3 --- --- ---Lead ppm 2 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 11 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 69 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 1 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 429 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 329 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8247 [WUSCAR] 06142987 (Generated: 04/12/2024 17:11:14) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: HUGH DOBBS - VOLVO8247
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 352798\Hydraulic System [VCP445538] 04 Apr 2024 @ 3950.0 hrs

