
[[X11234]] VOLVO L150H 6931 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP444823
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: X11234

SCOTT EQUIPMENT COMPANY LLC - Texarkana5401 SANDERSON LANETEXARKANA, ARUS  71854Contact: JAMES DOSSjdoss@scottcompanies.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Thecopper level is abnormal. All othercomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: VOLVO1034Unique No: 10968328Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 10 Apr 2024
Report Id: VOLVO1034 [WUSCAR] 06143520 (Generated: 04/10/2024 15:26:13) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JAMES DOSS - VOLVO1034

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP444823 VCP444813 VCP402919 VCP402926Sample Date 03 Apr 2024 08 Mar 2024 30 May 2023 27 Apr 2023Machine Hours 0 7343 6618 5340Oil Hours 7343 6839 0 0Oil Changed N/A Changed N/A Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.4 11.7 11.1 11.4Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 10.6 9.9 7.3 6.0Oxidation (PA) % 76 68 55 56
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.1 0.1 0.1 0.1Nitration (PA) % 53 39 77 68Sulfation (PA) % 58 57 52 47Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 1.0Silicon ppm 9 12 26 19Sodium ppm 4 0 0 3Potassium ppm 2 3 5 4
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 8 16 11 7Copper ppm 31 9 90 65Lead ppm 1 2 1 0Tin ppm 1 1 2 <1Aluminum ppm 2 51 <1 1Chromium ppm 1 4 0 0Molybdenum ppm 40 36 87 76Nickel ppm 2 <1 1 0Titanium ppm <1 <1 0 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 1 2 3 3Vanadium ppm <1 <1 0 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1587 1419 2188 2007Magnesium ppm 522 545 13 19Zinc ppm 1127 1045 1129 1127Phosphorus ppm 992 953 979 875Barium ppm <1 28 0 0Boron ppm 66 82 67 60

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO1034 [WUSCAR] 06143520 (Generated: 04/10/2024 15:26:16) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JAMES DOSS - VOLVO1034
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L150H 6931\Diesel Engine [VCP444823] 03 Apr 2024 @ .0 hrs

