
[[X11234]] VOLVO L150H 6931 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP444825
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: X11234

SCOTT EQUIPMENT COMPANY LLC - Texarkana5401 SANDERSON LANETEXARKANA, ARUS  71854Contact: JAMIE WARRENjwarren@scottcompanies.comT: (870)772-0204F: 
Diagnosis
We recommend you service the filterson this component. Resample at thenext service interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is a high amount ofparticulates present in the oil.Additive levels indicate the additionof a different brand, or type of oil.The AN level is acceptable for thisfluid.

Depot: VOLVO1034Unique No: 10968492Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 12 Apr 2024
Report Id: VOLVO1034 [WUSCAR] 06143684 (Generated: 04/12/2024 11:11:36) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JAMIE WARREN - VOLVO1034

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP444825 VCP444824 VCP402927 VCP402929Sample Date 03 Apr 2024 08 Mar 2024 30 May 2023 27 Apr 2023Machine Hours 0 7343 6618 5340Oil Hours 7343 3239 0 0Oil Changed N/A N/A N/A Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 45.1 46.9 43.5 43.0Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 1.14 0.51 0.68 0.34
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGParticles >4µm 45719 10221 --- 2350Particles >6µm 11289 766 --- 311Particles >14µm 549 33 --- 15ISO 4406:1999 (c) 23/21/16 21/17/12 --- 18/15/11Silicon ppm 2 <1 22 <1Sodium ppm <1 3 <1 0Potassium ppm 0 0 0 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 2 0 0 0Copper ppm 0 <1 2 <1Lead ppm 0 0 0 0Tin ppm <1 0 0 0Aluminum ppm 0 <1 <1 0Chromium ppm <1 0 0 0Molybdenum ppm 3 1 0 0Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 0 0 0 <1Vanadium ppm 0 <1 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1630 97 49 48Magnesium ppm 24 11 <1 4Zinc ppm 677 387 412 382Phosphorus ppm 768 313 307 305Barium ppm 0 <1 0 0Boron ppm 3 <1 0 0

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO1034 [WUSCAR] 06143684 (Generated: 04/12/2024 11:11:39) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JAMIE WARREN - VOLVO1034
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L150H 6931\Hydraulic System [VCP444825] 03 Apr 2024 @ .0 hrs

