
[[687082 DIPRO]] MCC R230 91592 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP438822
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 687082 DIPRO

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY - METRO WEST56195 PONTIAC TRAILNEW HUDSON, MIUS  48165Contact: PAUL CONZpaul.conz@altg.comT: (313)348-8861F: (248)356-2029
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.Aluminum andiron ppm levels are abnormal. Thereis no indication of any contaminationin the oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO2990Unique No: 10968721Signed: Angela BorellaReport Date: 12 Apr 2024
Report Id: VOLVO2990 [WUSCAR] 06143913 (Generated: 04/12/2024 11:15:30) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PAUL CONZ - VOLVO2990

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP438822 VCP421763 --- ---Sample Date 26 Mar 2024 30 Mar 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 3998 0 --- ---Oil Hours 500 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.5 12.7 --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 6.0 6.6 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 118 114 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Soot % % 2.1 1.6 --- ---Nitration (PA) % 146 133 --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 89 82 --- ---Glycol % NEG NEG --- ---Fuel % <1.0 <1.0 --- ---Silicon ppm 11 19 --- ---Sodium ppm 8 14 --- ---Potassium ppm <1 4 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 213 468 --- ---Copper ppm 12 55 --- ---Lead ppm <1 <1 --- ---Tin ppm 0 <1 --- ---Aluminum ppm 28 95 --- ---Chromium ppm 4 9 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 81 139 --- ---Nickel ppm 2 2 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 2 6 --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 <1 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2173 2532 --- ---Magnesium ppm 467 942 --- ---Zinc ppm 1269 1621 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1145 1266 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 16 75 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO2990 [WUSCAR] 06143913 (Generated: 04/12/2024 11:15:32) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PAUL CONZ - VOLVO2990
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	MCC MCC R230 91592\Diesel Engine [VCP438822] 26 Mar 2024 @ 3998.0 hrs

