
[[527030 RENTAL]] VOLVO A25G 752592 - WET DISC BRAKE

Sample No: VCP444189
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 15W40
Job No: 527030 RENTAL

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT LLC8418 PALM RIVER ROADTAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: KENNY HANEYkhaney@flaglerce.comT: (813)630-0077F: (813)630-2233
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Thecopper level is abnormal. All othercomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0093Unique No: 10969517Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 13 Apr 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06144709 (Generated: 04/13/2024 11:55:11) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KENNY HANEY - VOLVO0093

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP444189 VCP432056 --- ---Sample Date 04 Apr 2024 27 Sep 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 1758 1045 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed N/A N/A --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 44.9 44.3 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Silicon ppm 13 17 --- ---Sodium ppm 3 2 --- ---Potassium ppm <1 1 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 8 8 --- ---Copper ppm 132 97 --- ---Lead ppm 1 <1 --- ---Tin ppm 0 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 5 --- ---Chromium ppm 0 0 --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 --- ---Nickel ppm <1 <1 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm <1 <1 --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3595 3874 --- ---Magnesium ppm 11 15 --- ---Zinc ppm 1426 1624 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1151 1334 --- ---Barium ppm <1 0 --- ---Boron ppm 111 128 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06144709 (Generated: 04/13/2024 11:55:14) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KENNY HANEY - VOLVO0093
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A25G 752592\Wet Disc Brake [VCP444189] 04 Apr 2024 @ 1758.0 hrs

