
[[SPM689436]] 5378 VOLVO L180H 5378 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: DJJ022704
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: SPM689436

TRADEMARK METALS RECYCLING - EVERGLADES3440 NW 135TH STOPA LOCKA, FLUS  33054Contact: RYAN BOWDEN
T: F: (305)681-4914
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: TRAOPAUnique No: 10969523Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 11 Apr 2024
Report Id: TRAOPA [WUSCAR] 06144715 (Generated: 06/14/2024 16:31:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RYAN BOWDEN - TRAOPA

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number DJJ022704 VCP433339 VCP312210 ---Sample Date 05 Apr 2024 22 Nov 2023 03 May 2021 ---Machine Hours 7610 6747 626 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed Changed Changed Not Changd ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 40.7 40.6 39.9 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG ---Silicon ppm 16 11 20 ---Sodium ppm 4 6 19 ---Potassium ppm 0 2 7 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 109 161 49 ---Copper ppm 17 50 8 ---Lead ppm <1 1 1 ---Tin ppm 0 0 <1 ---Aluminum ppm <1 <1 1 ---Chromium ppm 2 3 3 ---Molybdenum ppm <1 1 4 ---Nickel ppm <1 1 <1 ---Titanium ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm 3 4 5 ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 <1 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3390 3529 8675 ---Magnesium ppm 10 0 23 ---Zinc ppm 1479 1644 3712 ---Phosphorus ppm 1166 1190 3003 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 41 122 275 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: TRAOPA [WUSCAR] 06144715 (Generated: 06/14/2024 16:31:06) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RYAN BOWDEN - TRAOPA
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO 5378 VOLVO L180H 5378\Front Axle [DJJ022704] 05 Apr 2024 @ 7610.0 hrs

