
[[497592 ALTER PEORIA]] SENNEBOGEN 835M 835.0.2632 - COOLANT

Sample No: VCP431492
Oil Type: FLEETGUARD BLUE
Job No: 497592 ALTER PEORIA

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY1035 WYLIE DRIVEBLOOMINGTON, ILUS  61705Contact: JUSTIN PERRYjustin.perry@altg.comT: (309)533-9285F: 
Diagnosis
The fluid is suitable for furtherservice. There is no indication of anycontamination in the coolant. Thecarboxylate level of this fluid isacceptable. The glycol level isacceptable. The pH level of this fluidis within the acceptable limits.

Depot: VOLVO5054Unique No: 10969648Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 15 Apr 2024
Report Id: VOLVO5054 [WUSCAR] 06144840 (Generated: 04/15/2024 10:46:59) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JUSTIN PERRY - VOLVO5054

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP431492 --- --- ---Sample Date 15 Mar 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 9526 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITIONpH Scale 0-14 7.78 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm 3044 --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 57.3 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -52 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONCoolant Appearance normal --- --- ---Coolant Color Black --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO5054 [WUSCAR] 06144840 (Generated: 04/15/2024 10:47:01) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JUSTIN PERRY - VOLVO5054
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SENNEBOGEN SENNEBOGEN 835M 835.0.2632\Coolant [VCP431492] 15 Mar 2024 @ 9526.0 hrs

