
[[687521 APTIM]] VOLVO A35G 340236 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP437936
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 687521 APTIM

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT LLC8418 PALM RIVER ROADTAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: JOHN FARDELLAjohn.fardella@altg.comT: (813)630-0077F: (813)630-2233
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The oilviscosity is lower than normal. TheBN result indicates that there issuitable alkalinity remaining in the oil.Confirm oil type.

Depot: VOLVO0093Unique No: 10970506Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 16 Apr 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06145698 (Generated: 04/16/2024 08:30:28) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN FARDELLA - VOLVO0093

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP437936 VCP440002 VCP435656 VCP420237Sample Date 12 Mar 2024 26 Feb 2024 25 Oct 2023 25 May 2023Machine Hours 8945 7992 7463 6888Oil Hours 500 500 500 500Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status ATTENTION NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 11.7 12.0 12.1 12.1Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.6 9.1 8.7 9.5Oxidation (PA) % 81 80 76 83
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.2 0.3 0.3 0.2Nitration (PA) % 69 70 67 61Sulfation (PA) % 60 59 59 60Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 1.3Silicon ppm 5 6 6 4Sodium ppm 2 3 3 2Potassium ppm <1 2 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 8 8 7 6Copper ppm 1 2 1 <1Lead ppm 2 1 <1 0Tin ppm <1 1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 2 5 3 0Chromium ppm <1 0 <1 0Molybdenum ppm 41 42 42 42Nickel ppm 2 3 1 <1Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 <1 <1 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1846 1626 1579 1648Magnesium ppm 540 527 526 504Zinc ppm 1222 1110 1123 1072Phosphorus ppm 972 912 931 894Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 24 24 22 31

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06145698 (Generated: 04/16/2024 08:30:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN FARDELLA - VOLVO0093
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A35G 340236\Diesel Engine [VCP437936] 12 Mar 2024 @ 8945.0 hrs

