
[[SWA507984-20]] GENIE S45H S45H26178 - DIESEL FUEL

Sample No: VCP295919
Oil Type: No.2 DIESEL FUEL (ULTRALOW SULPHUR)
Job No: SWA507984-20

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY- BYRON CENTER8840 BYRON COMMERCE DR SWBYRON CENTER, MIUS  49315Contact: MATT BURTONMATT.BURTON@ALTAEQUIPMENT.COMT: (616)345-7040F: (616)878-7650
Diagnosis
We recommend drain/flushsystem.All metal levels are normalindicating no corrosion in the coolingsystem. Free water present. There is amoderate amount of visible siltpresent in the sample. Water appearsto be from DEF. The fuel is no longerserviceable due to the presence ofcontaminants.

Depot: VOLVO0046Unique No: 10976364Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 18 Apr 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0046 [WUSCAR] 06146286 (Generated: 04/18/2024 11:10:08) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT BURTON - VOLVO0046

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP295919 --- --- ---Sample Date 08 Apr 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1928 --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 FUEL CONDITIONSulfur ppm 0 --- --- ---Visc @ 40°C cSt 2.66 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.010 --- --- ---Lead ppm 1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0046 [WUSCAR] 06146286 (Generated: 04/18/2024 11:10:09) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT BURTON - VOLVO0046
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	GENIE GENIE S45H S45H26178\Diesel Fuel [VCP295919] 08 Apr 2024 @ 1928.3 hrs

