
[[SW1032187 MGC]] VOLVO L110H 631398 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP442950
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 15W40
Job No: SW1032187 MGC

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY4323 EAST WINSLOW AVENUEPHOENIX, AZUS  85040Contact: RANDY PRZEKURATrandyp@arnoldmachinery.comT: F: (602)414-1904
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.The aluminum level isabnormal. All other component wearrates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: VOLVO6174Unique No: 10977086Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 15 Apr 2024
Report Id: VOLVO6174 [WUSCAR] 06147008 (Generated: 04/15/2024 16:47:33) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY PRZEKURAT - VOLVO6174

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP442950 VCP397985 VCP316158 VCP297398Sample Date 04 Apr 2024 13 Jan 2023 11 Jun 2021 04 Dec 2020Machine Hours 3107 2544 2025 1744Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.8 13.1 13.2 14.0Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.5 10.8 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 65 77 86 91
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.2 0.3 0.3 0.5Nitration (PA) % 61 68 60 74Sulfation (PA) % 53 59 66 66Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 4 9 6 15Sodium ppm 2 2 4 4Potassium ppm 0 <1 <1 3
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 10 15 15 26Copper ppm <1 2 2 5Lead ppm 0 <1 <1 0Tin ppm 0 2 1 0Aluminum ppm 16 14 8 23Chromium ppm 0 1 1 2Molybdenum ppm 58 45 59 39Nickel ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Titanium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Manganese ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 <1 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1362 1580 1643 1808Magnesium ppm 954 469 487 538Zinc ppm 1308 1052 997 884Phosphorus ppm 1127 877 900 743Barium ppm 0 1 0 0Boron ppm 4 43 64 40

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO6174 [WUSCAR] 06147008 (Generated: 04/15/2024 16:47:36) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY PRZEKURAT - VOLVO6174
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L110H 631398\Diesel Engine [VCP442950] 04 Apr 2024 @ 3107.0 hrs

