
[[SW31580 SWAGGART BRO]] VOLVO L220H 3301 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP378782
Oil Type: MOBIL 15W40
Job No: SW31580 SWAGGART BRO

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY3330 NORTH YELLOWSTONE HIGHWAYIDAHO FALLS, IDUS  83401Contact: JASON MERRILLjmerrill@arnoldmachinery.comT: (208)523-0822F: (208)523-9918
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. Tests indicate that thereis no fuel present in the oil. There isno indication of any contamination inthe oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: VOLVO0077Unique No: 10977088Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 18 Apr 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0077 [WUSCAR] 06147010 (Generated: 04/18/2024 10:41:11) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JASON MERRILL - VOLVO0077

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP378782 VCP406273 VCP400964 VCP375291Sample Date 03 Apr 2024 02 Aug 2023 27 Apr 2023 20 Jan 2023Machine Hours 4634 4402 4166 3610Oil Hours 500 350 500 500Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.9 13.0 12.7 13.2Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.2 8.3 7.4 9.5Oxidation (PA) % 61 57 57 57
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.2 0.2 0.2 0.1Nitration (PA) % 62 54 58 51Sulfation (PA) % 54 51 48 51Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % 0.3 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 2 3 3 4Sodium ppm 2 <1 <1 0Potassium ppm 0 2 0 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 4 5 3 4Copper ppm 6 4 5 7Lead ppm 0 <1 0 2Tin ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 0 1 <1 0Chromium ppm 0 <1 0 <1Molybdenum ppm 64 67 54 61Nickel ppm 0 <1 0 <1Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 <1 0 0Manganese ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 <1 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1262 1217 1068 1426Magnesium ppm 953 867 701 992Zinc ppm 1227 1181 939 1418Phosphorus ppm 1058 994 780 1088Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 13 20 38 31

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0077 [WUSCAR] 06147010 (Generated: 04/18/2024 10:41:14) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JASON MERRILL - VOLVO0077
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L220H 3301\Diesel Engine [VCP378782] 03 Apr 2024 @ 4634.0 hrs

