
[[SWA511448]] VOLVO A40G 340612 - BRAKE

Sample No: VCP423830
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No: SWA511448

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY- BYRON CENTER8840 BYRON COMMERCE DR SWBYRON CENTER, MIUS  49315Contact: MATT BURTONMATT.BURTON@ALTAEQUIPMENT.COMT: (616)345-7040F: (616)878-7650
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor. Pleasespecify the brand, type, and viscosityof the oil on your next sample.Theiron level is abnormal. The copperlevel is abnormal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe fluid. The condition of the fluid isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0046Unique No: 10977809Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 16 Apr 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0046 [WUSCAR] 06147731 (Generated: 04/16/2024 14:06:45) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT BURTON - VOLVO0046

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP423830 --- --- ---Sample Date 09 Apr 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 11337 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 42.2 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 26 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 5 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 81 --- --- ---Copper ppm 238 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 4 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 3 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3928 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 18 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1339 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1152 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 85 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0046 [WUSCAR] 06147731 (Generated: 04/16/2024 14:06:49) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT BURTON - VOLVO0046
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 340612\Brake [VCP423830] 09 Apr 2024 @ 11337.0 hrs

