
[[TRANSPORT LEASING]] VOLVO L220H 2268 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP440409
Oil Type: MOBIL ATF
Job No: TRANSPORT LEASING

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY464 WASHINGTON STREET STWIN FALLS, IDUS  83301Contact: JANAE HYMASjhymas@arnoldmachinery.comT: (208)733-1715F: (775)356-7152
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.The iron levelis abnormal. All other componentwear rates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe fluid. The condition of the fluid isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO1835Unique No: 10977923Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 16 Apr 2024
Report Id: VOLVO1835 [WUSCAR] 06147845 (Generated: 04/16/2024 13:59:08) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JANAE HYMAS - VOLVO1835

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP440409 VCP339796 VCP335622 VCP241891Sample Date 28 Mar 2024 11 Apr 2022 28 Jan 2022 06 Aug 2019Machine Hours 24936 18981 18124 10952Oil Hours 0 0 500 0Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Changed ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 26.0 27.2 23.6 30.9
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 7 5 13 4Sodium ppm 3 2 6 1Potassium ppm 7 1 15 1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 204 111 286 <1Copper ppm 10 5 13 <1Lead ppm <1 0 0 0Tin ppm <1 0 0 0Aluminum ppm 2 1 2 0Chromium ppm <1 0 <1 0Molybdenum ppm 1 <1 <1 <1Nickel ppm <1 0 0 0Titanium ppm <1 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 2 0 0Manganese ppm 2 <1 4 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 126 116 195 168Magnesium ppm 5 2 0 2Zinc ppm 19 12 32 20Phosphorus ppm 235 228 260 211Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 90 97 58 67

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO1835 [WUSCAR] 06147845 (Generated: 04/16/2024 13:59:11) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JANAE HYMAS - VOLVO1835
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L220H 2268\Transmission (Auto) [VCP440409] 28 Mar 2024 @ 24936.0 hrs

