
[[W02008186]] VOLVO A30D 14025 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: ML0001592
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No: W02008186

WILLIAM HAZELPO BOX 600CHANTILLY, VAUS  20153Contact: SERVICE MANAGERjimmy_elswick@wahazel.comT: (703)378-8300F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. Please specify the brand,type, and viscosity of the oil on yournext sample.All component wearrates are normal. The amount andsize of particulates present in thesystem are acceptable. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The AN level is acceptable forthis fluid. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: WILCHAUnique No: 10980310Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 18 Apr 2024
Report Id: WILCHA [WUSCAR] 06150232 (Generated: 04/24/2024 15:06:48) Rev: 1 Submitted By: DARRELL ANDES

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number ML0001592 --- --- ---Sample Date 12 Apr 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 21012 --- --- ---Oil Hours 500 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 49.1 --- --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.72 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Particles >4µm 31276 --- --- ---Particles >6µm 1084 --- --- ---Particles >14µm 43 --- --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 22/17/13 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 19 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 6 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 6 --- --- ---Copper ppm 9 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 5 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 2 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2239 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 24 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 925 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 822 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 73 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: WILCHA [WUSCAR] 06150232 (Generated: 04/24/2024 15:06:51) Rev: 1 Submitted By: DARRELL ANDES
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A30D 14025\Hydraulic System [ML0001592] 12 Apr 2024 @ 21012.0 hrs

