
[[512280 LIBERTY]] GENIE S-65 S6011-22685 - REAR LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP454256
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 80W90
Job No: 512280 LIBERTY

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY1035 WYLIE DRIVEBLOOMINGTON, ILUS  61705Contact: MIKE MARTINmike.martin@altaequipment.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. We advisethat you inspect for the source(s) ofwear. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.Bearing and/or gear wear isindicated. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The oilis no longer serviceable as a result ofthe abnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: VOLVO5054Unique No: 10980883Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 19 Apr 2024
Report Id: VOLVO5054 [WUSCAR] 06150805 (Generated: 04/19/2024 10:35:35) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE MARTIN - VOLVO5054

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP454256 --- --- ---Sample Date 03 Apr 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 2050 --- --- ---Oil Hours 2050 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 142 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 58 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 24 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 3 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 679 --- --- ---Copper ppm 150 --- --- ---Lead ppm 610 --- --- ---Tin ppm 8 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 8 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 9 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 13 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 45 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 7 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 82 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 236 --- --- ---Barium ppm 33 --- --- ---Boron ppm 12 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO5054 [WUSCAR] 06150805 (Generated: 04/19/2024 10:35:37) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE MARTIN - VOLVO5054
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	GENIE GENIE S-65 S6011-22685\Rear Left Final Drive [VCP454256] 03 Apr 2024 @ 2050.0 hrs

