
VOLVO EC480EL 314073 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP405673
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No:

STEPHEN HARTMAN EXCAVATING INC8554 W COUNTY RD 442MANISTIQUE, MIUS  49854Contact: STEVE HARTMANgpeterson@hartmanexcavating.comT: (906)341-2707F: 
Diagnosis
We recommend you service the filterson this component. Resample at thenext service interval to monitor. Wewere unable to perform a particlecount due to a high concentration ofparticles present in this sample. (valvefailure).All component wear rates arenormal. Moderate concentration ofvisible dirt/debris present in the oil.The AN level is acceptable for thisfluid. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: STEMANMIUnique No: 10981130Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 19 Apr 2024
Report Id: STEMANMI [WUSCAR] 06151052 (Generated: 04/20/2024 07:28:35) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEVE HARTMAN - STEMANMI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP405673 --- --- ---Sample Date 02 Apr 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 6500 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 41.7 --- --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.43 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 2 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 7 --- --- ---Copper ppm 7 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 53 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 19 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 444 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 351 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: STEMANMI [WUSCAR] 06151052 (Generated: 04/20/2024 07:28:36) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEVE HARTMAN - STEMANMI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC480EL 314073\Hydraulic System [VCP405673] 02 Apr 2024 @ 6500.0 hrs

