
VOLVO ECR235E 314041 - SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP0007801
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No:

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY8750 PHILIPS HWYJACKSONVILLE, FLUS  32256Contact: SHAWN NORTHCRAFTshawn.northcraft@altg.comT: (904)737-6000F: (904)737-1260
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. Resample atthe next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. Appearance is milky.There is a moderate concentration ofwater present in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0092Unique No: 10982409Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 22 Apr 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0092 [WUSCAR] 06152331 (Generated: 04/23/2024 04:12:10) Rev: 1 Submitted By: TECHNICIAN ACCOUNT

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP0007801 VCP330343 --- ---Sample Date 15 Apr 2024 02 May 2022 --- ---Machine Hours 1037 1037 --- ---Oil Hours 1037 1000 --- ---Oil Changed N/A Changed --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 348 182 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.450 NEG --- ---Silicon ppm 6 11 --- ---Sodium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Potassium ppm 1 0 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 168 593 --- ---Copper ppm 12 34 --- ---Lead ppm 2 0 --- ---Tin ppm 1 <1 --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 3 --- ---Chromium ppm 3 7 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 1 <1 --- ---Nickel ppm 1 0 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Silver ppm <1 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 3 8 --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 15 9 --- ---Magnesium ppm 3 0 --- ---Zinc ppm 18 33 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1148 478 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 193 <1 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0092 [WUSCAR] 06152331 (Generated: 04/23/2024 04:12:12) Rev: 1 Submitted By: TECHNICIAN ACCOUNT
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO ECR235E 314041\Swing Drive [VCP0007801] 15 Apr 2024 @ 1037.0 hrs

