
[[X47784]] VOLVO A25G 752361 - BOGIE/CENTER AXLE

Sample No: VCP452395
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER GEAR OIL 75W-80-GO102
Job No: X47784

SCOTT EQUIPMENT COMPANY LLC - Lavergne1231 BRIDGESTONE PARKWAYLAVERGNE, TNUS  37086Contact: ANDY CHAMBERSachambers@scottcompanies.comT: F: (615)793-9655
Diagnosis
We advise that you inspect for thesource(s) of metal. Resample at thenext service interval to monitor.Highconcentration of visible yellow metalpresent. All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Confirmoil type. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0129Unique No: 10982411Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 22 Apr 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0129 [WUSCAR] 06152333 (Generated: 04/23/2024 04:13:14) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ANDY CHAMBERS - VOLVO0129

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP452395 VC381646 VC437419 VCE00953Sample Date 10 Apr 2024 30 Aug 2022 10 May 2022 17 Mar 2022Machine Hours 3520 2003 1186 593Oil Hours 0 2003 500 593Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Changed ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 139 129 130 92.4
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 4 2 2 3Sodium ppm 0 0 0 0Potassium ppm 1 1 1 4
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 123 42 127 225Copper ppm 56 6 14 35Lead ppm 1 0 <1 0Tin ppm 4 <1 <1 1Aluminum ppm 1 0 0 0Chromium ppm 2 <1 2 4Molybdenum ppm 1 <1 3 12Nickel ppm 2 0 0 0Titanium ppm <1 0 0 0Silver ppm <1 0 0 0Manganese ppm 2 1 3 10Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 30 49 114 588Magnesium ppm 1 <1 7 <1Zinc ppm 9 6 62 253Phosphorus ppm 978 516 682 1401Barium ppm 0 0 2 0Boron ppm 159 15 54 289

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0129 [WUSCAR] 06152333 (Generated: 04/23/2024 04:13:19) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ANDY CHAMBERS - VOLVO0129
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A25G 752361\Bogie/Center Axle [VCP452395] 10 Apr 2024 @ 3520.0 hrs

