
VOLVO A45G 79 (S/N 342558) - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VC06152512
Oil Type: SHELL ROTELLA T 15W40
Job No:

J.M. HUBER10322 HWY 53 EMARBLE HILL, GAUS  30148Contact: GEORGE GIBSONgeorge.gibson@huber.comT: (770)893-7602F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of the coolant leak. Check forlow coolant level. We recommendthat you drain the oil and perform afilter service on this component if notalready done. We recommend anearly resample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. Sodium and/orpotassium levels are high. Test forglycol is positive. Fuel contentnegligible. There is a highconcentration of glycol present in theoil. The oil viscosity is lower thannormal. Confirm oil type. The oil is nolonger serviceable.

Depot: JMHMARUnique No: 10982590Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 22 Apr 2024
Report Id: JMHMAR [WUSCAR] 06152512 (Generated: 04/23/2024 06:29:42) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: GEORGE GIBSON - JMHMAR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VC06152512 VCP06115622 VCP405326 VCP423719Sample Date 02 Apr 2024 04 Dec 2023 01 Oct 2023 01 Jun 2023Machine Hours 0 0 12523 0Oil Hours 0 0 500 0Oil Changed N/A N/A Changed ChangedSample Status SEVERE SEVERE NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.4 13.1 13.0 12.9Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 6.0 5.7 5.5 6.1Oxidation (PA) % 58 69 75 78
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 1 1.2 1.5 1.6Nitration (PA) % 86 93 90 101Sulfation (PA) % 71 72 73 73Glycol % 0.20 0.10 NEG NEGFuel % 0.4 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 14 7 5 5Sodium ppm 543 273 14 10Potassium ppm 1445 422 11 13
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 53 25 30 33Copper ppm 4 2 2 5Lead ppm 4 1 2 4Tin ppm 2 0 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 8 8 9 13Chromium ppm 3 <1 1 2Molybdenum ppm 57 43 32 64Nickel ppm 4 2 2 5Titanium ppm <1 0 0 <1Silver ppm <1 0 0 0Manganese ppm 2 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3115 2169 1988 1791Magnesium ppm 110 88 205 368Zinc ppm 1539 1035 1223 1231Phosphorus ppm 1412 904 961 1069Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 22 13 19 18

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: JMHMAR [WUSCAR] 06152512 (Generated: 04/23/2024 06:29:46) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: GEORGE GIBSON - JMHMAR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 79 (S/N 342558)\Diesel Engine [VC06152512] 02 Apr 2024 @ .0 hrs

