
VOLVO EC300E 318112 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP305795
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No:

COWIN EQUIPMENT COMPANY INC - GUNTERSVILLE15101 ALABAMA HWY 20MADISON, ALUS  35756Contact: J. VELOSKYjvelosky@cowin.comT: (256)350-0006F: (256)355-5250
Diagnosis
We recommend you service the filterson this component. Resample at thenext service interval to monitor. Wewere unable to perform a particlecount due to a high concentration ofparticles present in this sample. Testsdo not reveal cause for reportedproblem.All component wear ratesare normal. Moderate concentrationof visible dirt/debris present in theoil. The AN level is acceptable for thisfluid. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: COWMADUnique No: 10983081Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 22 Apr 2024
Report Id: COWMAD [WUSCAR] 06153003 (Generated: 04/23/2024 15:36:46) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: J. VELOSKY - COWMAD

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP305795 VCP418036 --- ---Sample Date 05 Apr 2024 04 Apr 2024 --- ---Machine Hours 22 22 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed N/A N/A --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 44.8 44.8 --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.53 0.55 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Silicon ppm 3 2 --- ---Sodium ppm 2 2 --- ---Potassium ppm 2 3 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 0 0 --- ---Copper ppm 7 7 --- ---Lead ppm 0 0 --- ---Tin ppm <1 <1 --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 0 --- ---Chromium ppm 0 0 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 0 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 0 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm <1 <1 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 100 100 --- ---Magnesium ppm 0 0 --- ---Zinc ppm 542 543 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 433 432 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 0 0 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: COWMAD [WUSCAR] 06153003 (Generated: 04/23/2024 15:36:48) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: J. VELOSKY - COWMAD
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC300E 318112\Hydraulic System [VCP305795] 05 Apr 2024 @ 22.0 hrs

