
[[E15311 T DIONNE]] PONSEE A1305625 - SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP383659
Oil Type: PONSSE 75W90
Job No: E15311 T DIONNE

CHADWICK-BAROSS INC314 MAIN STREETCARIBOU, MEUS  04736Contact: ADAM THERIAULTtheriault@chadwick-baross.comT: F: (207)498-6596
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.Bearingand/or bushing wear is indicated.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0010Unique No: 10983562Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 23 Apr 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0010 [WUSCAR] 06153484 (Generated: 04/23/2024 09:51:06) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ADAM THERIAULT - VOLVO0010

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP383659 VCP419173 --- ---Sample Date 12 Apr 2024 17 Nov 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 2089 239 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 202 138 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Silicon ppm 3 0 --- ---Sodium ppm 0 0 --- ---Potassium ppm 1 0 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 81 6 --- ---Copper ppm 362 32 --- ---Lead ppm 19 2 --- ---Tin ppm 30 2 --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 0 --- ---Chromium ppm 1 0 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 15 <1 --- ---Nickel ppm 2 0 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 0 --- ---Silver ppm <1 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 2 0 --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 87 21 --- ---Magnesium ppm 8 20 --- ---Zinc ppm 200 9 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1161 255 --- ---Barium ppm 1 0 --- ---Boron ppm 363 14 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0010 [WUSCAR] 06153484 (Generated: 04/23/2024 09:51:09) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ADAM THERIAULT - VOLVO0010
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	PONSEE PONSEE A1305625\Swing Drive [VCP383659] 12 Apr 2024 @ 2089.0 hrs

