
[[512290 LIBERTY]] GENIE S-65 S60H-37857 - FRONT RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP433773
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 80W-90 GL-5
Job No: 512290 LIBERTY

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY1035 WYLIE DRIVEBLOOMINGTON, ILUS  61705Contact: JUSTIN PERRYjustin.perry@altg.comT: (309)533-9285F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO5054Unique No: 10983584Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 22 Apr 2024
Report Id: VOLVO5054 [WUSCAR] 06153506 (Generated: 04/22/2024 17:37:19) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JUSTIN PERRY - VOLVO5054

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP433773 --- --- ---Sample Date 03 Apr 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 2130 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 102 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 18 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 25 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 3 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 292 --- --- ---Copper ppm 5 --- --- ---Lead ppm 2 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 3 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 5 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 6 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 33 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 7 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 193 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 846 --- --- ---Barium ppm 24 --- --- ---Boron ppm 37 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO5054 [WUSCAR] 06153506 (Generated: 04/22/2024 17:37:22) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JUSTIN PERRY - VOLVO5054
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	GENIE GENIE S-65 S60H-37857\Front Right Final Drive [VCP433773] 03 Apr 2024 @ 2130.0 hrs

