
[[473401]] SENNEBOGEN 830 830.0.3516 - SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP432726
Oil Type: SHELL OMALA S4 GX 220
Job No: 473401

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY1035 WYLIE DRIVEBLOOMINGTON, ILUS  61705Contact: JUSTIN PERRYjustin.perry@altg.comT: (309)533-9285F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. The oil changeat the time of sampling has beennoted. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.Bearing and/or gear wear isindicated. Appearance is hazy. Thereis a moderate concentration of waterpresent in the oil. The condition ofthe oil is acceptable for the time inservice.

Depot: VOLVO5054Unique No: 10983587Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 22 Apr 2024
Report Id: VOLVO5054 [WUSCAR] 06153509 (Generated: 04/22/2024 17:36:58) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JUSTIN PERRY - VOLVO5054

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP432726 --- --- ---Sample Date 12 Apr 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 2053 --- --- ---Oil Hours 1000 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 229 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.526 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 7 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 3 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 716 --- --- ---Copper ppm 140 --- --- ---Lead ppm 1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 14 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 4 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 8 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 21 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 4 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 114 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 435 --- --- ---Barium ppm 3 --- --- ---Boron ppm 31 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO5054 [WUSCAR] 06153509 (Generated: 04/22/2024 17:37:01) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JUSTIN PERRY - VOLVO5054
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SENNEBOGEN SENNEBOGEN 830 830.0.3516\Swing Drive [VCP432726] 12 Apr 2024 @ 2053.0 hrs

