
[[X18443 RID GROUP]]  - TRANSMISSION (MANUAL)

Sample No: VCP410757
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No: X18443 RID GROUP

SCOTT EQUIPMENT COMPANY LLC - Jackson3860 I-55 SouthJACKSON, MSUS  39212Contact: DWIGHT MCDOUGALDMCDOUGAL@SCOTTCOMPANIES.COMT: F: (601)326-3359
Diagnosis
We recommend that you drain thefluid from the component if this hasnot already been done. We advisethat you inspect for the source(s) ofwear. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor this condition.Please specify the brand, type, andviscosity of the oil on your nextsample.Clutch disc and/or thrustwasher wear is indicated. Moderateconcentration of visible dirt/debrispresent in the fluid. Confirm oil type.

Depot: VOLVO8771Unique No: 10983620Signed: Angela BorellaReport Date: 22 Apr 2024
Report Id: VOLVO8771 [WUSCAR] 06153542 (Generated: 04/22/2024 23:46:24) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DWIGHT MCDOUGAL - VOLVO8771

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP410757 --- --- ---Sample Date 15 Apr 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 5691 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 34.9 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 5 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 4 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 19 --- --- ---Copper ppm 304 --- --- ---Lead ppm 590 --- --- ---Tin ppm 2 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 2 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1954 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 6 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 760 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 788 --- --- ---Barium ppm 2 --- --- ---Boron ppm 32 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8771 [WUSCAR] 06153542 (Generated: 04/22/2024 23:46:27) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DWIGHT MCDOUGAL - VOLVO8771
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	TEREX \Transmission (Manual) [VCP410757] 15 Apr 2024 @ 5691.0 hrs

