
[[51535]] VOLVO L120H 632867 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP445361
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No: 51535

367 - ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC - BUFORD3779 RYDER BLVDBUFORD, GAUS  30519Contact: Dana Vaccarodana.vaccaro@ascendummachinery.comT: (678)318-9500F: (678)318-9534
Diagnosis
We advise that you check the airfilter, air induction system, and anyareas where dirt may enter thecomponent. We recommend that youdrain the oil and perform a filterservice on this component if notalready done. We recommend anearly resample to monitor thiscondition.Piston and cylinder wear isindicated. Elemental levels of silicon(Si) and aluminum (Al) indicatealumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress.The BN result indicates that there issuitable alkalinity remaining in the oil.The oil is no longer serviceable dueto the presence of contaminants.

Depot: VOLVO8529Unique No: 10989313Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 23 Apr 2024
Report Id: VOLVO8529 [WUSCAR] 06153890 (Generated: 04/24/2024 09:14:17) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Dana Vaccaro - VOLVO8529

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP445361 --- --- ---Sample Date 12 Apr 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 6165 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.6 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 6.1 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 111 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Soot % % 2.7 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 117 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 88 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 68 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 115 --- --- ---Copper ppm 7 --- --- ---Lead ppm 4 --- --- ---Tin ppm 3 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 53 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 4 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 67 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1326 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 1184 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1355 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1136 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 29 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8529 [WUSCAR] 06153890 (Generated: 04/24/2024 09:14:20) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Dana Vaccaro - VOLVO8529
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L120H 632867\Diesel Engine [VCP445361] 12 Apr 2024 @ 6165.0 hrs

