
[[SPM674733]] CATERPILLAR D8T KPZ01336 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP430162
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: SPM674733

ALTA EQUIPMENT CO - ORLAND PARK5000 INDUSTRIAL HWYGARY, INUS  46406Contact: DAVE ENGDAVE.ENG@ALTG.COMT: (312)350-2560F: 
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. We advisethat you inspect for the source(s) ofwear. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor this condition.We were unable to perform a particlecount due to a high concentration ofparticles present in this sample.Theiron level is severe. The chromiumlevel is severe. Elemental level ofsilicon (Si) above normal. Moderateconcentration of visible dirt/debrispresent in the oil. The AN level isacceptable for this fluid.

Depot: VOLVO8885Unique No: 10989700Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 23 Apr 2024
Report Id: VOLVO8885 [WUSCAR] 06154277 (Generated: 04/23/2024 14:04:58) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVE ENG - VOLVO8885

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP430162 VCP429888 VCP420663 VCP400812Sample Date 12 Apr 2024 02 Nov 2023 25 Aug 2023 21 Feb 2023Machine Hours 11275 9815 9433 7449Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status SEVERE SEVERE SEVERE NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 41.4 42.1 43.5 44.5Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.50 0.51 0.91 0.94
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGParticles >4µm --- --- --- 1917Particles >6µm --- --- --- 322Particles >14µm --- --- --- 23ISO 4406:1999 (c) --- --- --- 18/16/12Silicon ppm 34 8 27 5Sodium ppm 4 2 0 1Potassium ppm 3 0 3 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 195 55 177 5Copper ppm 50 8 34 5Lead ppm 2 0 3 1Tin ppm <1 0 <1 0Aluminum ppm 4 0 3 2Chromium ppm 28 9 17 <1Molybdenum ppm 1 <1 3 1Nickel ppm 2 0 <1 0Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 3 <1 1 0Vanadium ppm 0 <1 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 287 189 566 450Magnesium ppm 17 6 26 23Zinc ppm 627 464 882 773Phosphorus ppm 525 396 765 664Barium ppm 0 0 2 0Boron ppm 13 2 13 <1

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8885 [WUSCAR] 06154277 (Generated: 04/23/2024 14:05:00) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVE ENG - VOLVO8885
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	CATERPILLAR CATERPILLAR D8T KPZ01336\Hydraulic System [VCP430162] 12 Apr 2024 @ 11275.0 hrs

