
[[SPM701371]] VOLVO ECR235EL 310702 - SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP443526
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 80W90
Job No: SPM701371

ALTA EQUIPMENT CO - ORLAND PARK5000 INDUSTRIAL HWYGARY, INUS  46406Contact: DAVE ENGDAVE.ENG@ALTG.COMT: (312)350-2560F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. The oil changeat the time of sampling has beennoted. We advise that you inspect forthe source(s) of wear. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.The copperlevel is severe. Bearing and/orbushing wear is indicated. Iron andchrome levels are severe.Gear wear isindicated. There is a highconcentration of water present in theoil. Viscosity is higher thannormal.The oil is no longerserviceable as a result of water andthe abnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: VOLVO8885Unique No: 10990224Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 23 Apr 2024
Report Id: VOLVO8885 [WUSCAR] 06154801 (Generated: 04/23/2024 18:42:02) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVE ENG - VOLVO8885

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP443526 VCP350049 --- ---Sample Date 12 Apr 2024 02 Mar 2022 --- ---Machine Hours 4256 3512 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Not Changd --- ---Sample Status SEVERE SEVERE --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 501 184 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 9.04 0.402 --- ---Silicon ppm 72 16 --- ---Sodium ppm 4 0 --- ---Potassium ppm 3 6 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 14704 2233 --- ---Copper ppm 301 34 --- ---Lead ppm 4 <1 --- ---Tin ppm 5 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 16 29 --- ---Chromium ppm 120 21 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 27 4 --- ---Nickel ppm 8 2 --- ---Titanium ppm 6 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 134 20 --- ---Vanadium ppm 1 <1 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 43 6 --- ---Magnesium ppm 59 7 --- ---Zinc ppm 199 64 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 2488 601 --- ---Barium ppm <1 0 --- ---Boron ppm 18 20 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8885 [WUSCAR] 06154801 (Generated: 04/23/2024 18:42:05) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVE ENG - VOLVO8885
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO ECR235EL 310702\Swing Drive [VCP443526] 12 Apr 2024 @ 4256.0 hrs

