
[[SPM687839]] VOLVO A60H 340125 - BRAKE COOLING SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP436409
Oil Type: VOLVO WET BRAKE TRANSAXLE OIL
Job No: SPM687839

ALTA EQUIPMENT CO - ORLAND PARK5000 INDUSTRIAL HWYGARY, INUS  46406Contact: DAVE ENGDAVE.ENG@ALTG.COMT: (312)350-2560F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Gear wearis indicated. All other componentwear rates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe fluid. The fluid viscosity is higherthan normal. This plus the additivelevels indicates the addition of adifferent brand, or type of oil.Confirm oil type.

Depot: VOLVO8885Unique No: 10990248Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 23 Apr 2024
Report Id: VOLVO8885 [WUSCAR] 06154825 (Generated: 04/23/2024 18:57:02) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVE ENG - VOLVO8885

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP436409 VCP378775 --- ---Sample Date 12 Apr 2024 27 Aug 2022 --- ---Machine Hours 8696 6235 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd Changed --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 136 40.2 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Silicon ppm 2 18 --- ---Sodium ppm 3 7 --- ---Potassium ppm 2 2 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 324 50 --- ---Copper ppm 4 342 --- ---Lead ppm <1 1 --- ---Tin ppm <1 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 1 --- ---Chromium ppm 4 <1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 2 <1 --- ---Nickel ppm 3 3 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 <1 --- ---Manganese ppm 5 2 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 200 3414 --- ---Magnesium ppm 14 9 --- ---Zinc ppm 88 1497 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1021 1221 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 194 122 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8885 [WUSCAR] 06154825 (Generated: 04/23/2024 18:57:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVE ENG - VOLVO8885
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A60H 340125\Brake Cooling System [VCP436409] 12 Apr 2024 @ 8696.0 hrs

