
[[SPM700133]] SENNEBOGAN 825M 825.0.3415 - REAR RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP413906
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 80W90
Job No: SPM700133

ALL AMERICAN RECYCLING11900 S COTTAGE GROVE AVECHICAGO, ILUS  60628Contact: TOM BOCHENEKferrous@aarecylcles.comT: (815)735-9892F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: ALLCHIILUnique No: 10990323Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 24 Apr 2024
Report Id: ALLCHIIL [WUSCAR] 06154900 (Generated: 04/24/2024 08:46:56) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TOM BOCHENEK - ALLCHIIL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP413906 VCP415072 VCP418526 VCP410848Sample Date 12 Apr 2024 25 Aug 2023 08 May 2023 09 Mar 2023Machine Hours 8667 7037 6085 5539Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Changed Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 196 174 171 170
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 20 14 18 18Sodium ppm <1 4 2 0Potassium ppm 0 0 1 2
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 111 18 29 27Copper ppm 40 4 3 3Lead ppm 0 0 0 0Tin ppm 0 0 0 <1Aluminum ppm 1 1 <1 2Chromium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 2 <1 1 1Nickel ppm 0 0 <1 <1Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 3 2 3 3Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2219 2396 2351 2374Magnesium ppm 25 31 20 20Zinc ppm 999 985 1016 993Phosphorus ppm 847 853 865 840Barium ppm 1 <1 0 0Boron ppm 10 20 18 21

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: ALLCHIIL [WUSCAR] 06154900 (Generated: 04/24/2024 08:46:59) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TOM BOCHENEK - ALLCHIIL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SENNEBOGEN SENNEBOGAN 825M 825.0.3415\Rear Right Final Drive [VCP413906] 12 Apr 2024 @ 8667.0 hrs

