
[[12839]] VOLVO L60H 622945 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VC510552
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No: 12839

TRANSOURCE TRUCK & EQUIPMENT901 EAST 60TH STREET NORTHSIOUX FALLS, SDUS  57104Contact: NATHAN MATZENnathan.matzen@transourceusa.comT: (605)336-2000F: (605)336-2248
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. Please specify the brand,type, and viscosity of the oil on yournext sample.All component wearrates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0035Unique No: 10990728Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 24 Apr 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0035 [WUSCAR] 06155305 (Generated: 04/24/2024 10:11:38) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: NATHAN MATZEN - VOLVO0035

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VC510552 --- --- ---Sample Date 16 Apr 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 4354 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 42.9 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 17 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 0 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 5 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 19 --- --- ---Copper ppm <1 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3908 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 13 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1494 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1211 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 143 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0035 [WUSCAR] 06155305 (Generated: 04/24/2024 10:11:41) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: NATHAN MATZEN - VOLVO0035
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L60H 622945\Front Axle [VC510552] 16 Apr 2024 @ 4354.0 hrs

