
[[A12465]] VOLVO A35G 352266 - DROP BOX

Sample No: VCP439378
Oil Type: MOBIL GO 102
Job No: A12465

JAMES J ANDERSON6958 TORRESDALE AVENUEPHILADELPHIA, PAUS  19135Contact: JOHN HERBUTherb@jjaconstruction.comT: (215)850-9051F: (215)427-0208
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. Werecommend that you drain the oilfrom the component if this has notalready been done. We advise thatyou inspect for the source(s) of wear.We recommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.The iron levelis abnormal. The copper level issevere. Appearance is milky. There isa high concentration of water presentin the oil. The oil is no longerserviceable due to the presence ofcontaminants.

Depot: JAAPHIUnique No: 10991727Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 24 Apr 2024
Report Id: JAAPHI [WUSCAR] 06156304 (Generated: 04/25/2024 15:13:57) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN HERBUT - JAAPHI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP439378 --- --- ---Sample Date 16 Apr 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 555 --- --- ---Oil Hours 555 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 53.5 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 2.26 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 36 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 13 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 16 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 522 --- --- ---Copper ppm 126 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 6 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 56 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 3 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 10 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 61 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 12 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 337 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 2313 --- --- ---Barium ppm 7 --- --- ---Boron ppm 172 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: JAAPHI [WUSCAR] 06156304 (Generated: 04/25/2024 15:13:59) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN HERBUT - JAAPHI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A35G 352266\Drop Box [VCP439378] 16 Apr 2024 @ 555.0 hrs

