
[[12839]] VOLVO L60H 622945 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VC510564
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 40
Job No: 12839

TRANSOURCE TRUCK & EQUIPMENT901 EAST 60TH STREET NORTHSIOUX FALLS, SDUS  57104Contact: BRAD MAUPINbrad.maupin@transourceusa.comT: F: (605)336-2248
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. The fluid was notspecified, however, a fluid matchindicates that this fluid is (GENERIC)DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 40.  Pleaseconfirm. All component wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: VOLVO0035Unique No: 10992072Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 23 Apr 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0035 [WUSCAR] 06156649 (Generated: 04/23/2024 17:35:33) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRAD MAUPIN - VOLVO0035

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VC510564 --- --- ---Sample Date 16 Apr 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 4354 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.5 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 6.2 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 53 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Soot % % 0.2 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 74 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 51 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 6 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 5 --- --- ---Copper ppm 1 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 50 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2274 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 21 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1163 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 977 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 30 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0035 [WUSCAR] 06156649 (Generated: 04/23/2024 17:35:36) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRAD MAUPIN - VOLVO0035
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L60H 622945\Diesel Engine [VC510564] 16 Apr 2024 @ 4354.0 hrs

